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NOTICE OF MATERIAL FACT 

MPM CORPÓREOS S.A., a Brazilian corporation registered with the Brazilian Securities and 
Exchange Commission (“CVM”) as a publicly-held company category “A” (“Company”) (B3: 
ESPA3), in compliance with the provisions of CVM Resolution No. 44 of August 23, 2021, as 
amended, and with the provisions of article 157, paragraph 4 of Law No. 6.404 of December 
15, 1976, as amended, in addition to the Material Fact and to the Notice to the Shareholders 
dated August 30, 2022, as well as to the Notice to the Shareholders dated October 6, 2022, 
hereby informs its shareholders and the market in general that, on the date hereof, its Board 
of Directors ratified the Company’s capital increase, within the limit of the authorized capital, 
in the amount of R$225,000,000.00, upon issue of 117,187,500 new common registered book-
entry shares, without par value (“Capital Increase”). The Capital Increase was placed at its 
Maximum Amount, as approved at a meeting of the Board of Directors held on August 30, 
2022. 

Of the price per share: (i) R$1.54 was allocated to the share capital, totaling the amount of 
R$180,468,750.00; and (ii) the balance of R$0.38 per share was allocated to the formation of 
capital reserve, in the form of the provisions of article 182, paragraph 1, letter ‘a’ of the Brazilian 
Corporation Law, totaling R$44,531,250.00. 

As a result of the Capital Increase ratified, the Company’s capital stock was increased from 
R$1,303,361,932.19, divided into 244,235,566 common shares, to R$1,483,830,682.19, divided 
into 361,423,066 common shares. 

The Company’s Investor Relations Department remains available to the shareholders to clarify 
any issues relating to the Capital Increase by means of the electronic address 
dri@espacolaser.com.br. 

The information and documents related to the Capital Increase are available for consultation on 
the websites of the Company (https://ir.espacolaser.com.br/), of the CVM 
(https://www.gov.br/cvm/pt-br), and of B3 S.A. – Brasil, Bolsa, Balcão 
(https://www.b3.com.br/pt_br/). 

São Paulo, October 26, 2022. 

 

Leonardo Moreira Dias Correa 
Financial and Investor Relations Officer 
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